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(57) ABSTRACT 
Systems and processes are disclosed for providing bill split 
ting processes for splitting a bill amount among a set of 
purchasers. In one example, the disclosed embodiments may 
receive receipt information reflecting a bill to be split among 
a group of purchasers. The disclosed embodiments may parse 
the receipt information to extract one or more items or Ser 
vices having monetary value and generate a list of the items or 
services included in the receipt. The disclosed embodiments 
may also identify the group of purchasers that will participate 
in paying a proportion of the bill associated with the receipt. 
Further, disclosed embodiments may be configured to deter 
mine a proportion of payment of the total amount of the bill 
for each purchaser in the group of purchasers. In addition, the 
disclosed embodiments may be configured to provide mecha 
nisms that enable at least one purchaser to provide payment 
for the at least one purchaser's payment amount for the bill, 
Such as providing interfaces that allow the user to pay elec 
tronically using e-commerce payment systems or financial 
service products. 

NETCRK CIENTS 
ERFACE 

CCONNS 
E06 

ANCA SErWCE ROWER 

2. 4. 

    

    

  

  

  



US 2014/O164234 A1 Jun. 12, 2014 Sheet 1 of 8 Patent Application Publication 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  



Patent Application Publication Jun. 12, 2014 Sheet 2 of 8 US 2014/O164234 A1 

Q 
al 
K 
Q 
- 
. 
. 

a. 

re 
e 
w 
. 

ha 

ii 

S. 

  



Patent Application Publication Jun. 12, 2014 Sheet 3 of 8 US 2014/O164234 A1 

RECE STEK ACAON 

ROCESS FOW 

RECEIVE KECE 

EXRAC RECEP 
NFORMATON 

OENTY 
PURCHASER(S) 

Sri B. 

COEC PAYMEN 

SEs 
2. 

SE 
22 

SE 
230 

SE 
24 

SE) 
250 

22 

FG. 2 

    

  

  



US 2014/O164234 A1 Jun. 12, 2014 Sheet 4 of 8 Patent Application Publication 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  



US 2014/O164234 A1 Jun. 12, 2014 Sheet 5 of 8 Patent Application Publication 

  



US 2014/O164234 A1 Jun. 12, 2014 Sheet 6 of 8 Patent Application Publication 

  



US 2014/O164234 A1 Jun. 12, 2014 Sheet 7 of 8 Patent Application Publication 

  

  



US 2014/O164234 A1 Jun. 12, 2014 Sheet 8 of 8 Patent Application Publication 

[ ?] oso D?? 
Áed og ÁæAA e ºsoo??O 

  



US 2014/0164234 A1 

SYSTEMIS AND METHODS FOR SPLTTING 
A BILL ASSOCATED WITH A RECEPT 

PRIORITY CLAIM 

0001. This application claims priority under 35 U.S.C. 
S119 to U.S. provisional patent application No. 61/736,305, 
filed on Dec. 12, 2012, and entitled “Systems and Methods for 
Splitting a Bill Associated with a Receipt.” The aforemen 
tioned application is incorporated herein by reference in its 
entirety. 

FIELD 

0002 The disclosed embodiments generally relate to 
financial service products and systems, and more particularly, 
to systems, processes, and computer programs for determin 
ing the amount to split a bill associated with a receipt and 
assist a user to distribute the payment for the bill associated 
with the receipt. 
0003 Electronic personal payment transactions, such as 
person-to-person payment and person-to-business payment, 
represent a rapidly growing industry. There still exist, how 
ever, situations where people prefer to split bills and collect 
payment without benefiting from the convenience that elec 
tronic personal payment systems bring. For example, situa 
tions may arise in dealing with sharing payment when a group 
of friends have dinner together. One situation involves one 
person paying for the bill in full, keeping the receipt of the 
bill, and collecting payment from others in the group. Another 
situation involves the group of friends going through the 
trouble of determining how much each person has to pay and 
coordinating with each other for making the payment in full. 
Still another involves the merchant having to split the bill 
evenly (or in certain proportions) among the group of friends. 

SUMMARY 

0004 Systems, methods, and articles of manufacture are 
disclosed for providing bill-splitting processes. In certain 
embodiments, systems, methods and computer programs are 
disclosed for splitting a bill associated with a receipt among a 
group of purchasers and assisting each of the group of pur 
chasers to make the payment. Disclosed embodiments 
include mechanisms that receive a receipt of a bill to be split 
among a group of purchasers. The disclosed embodiments 
may parse information in the receipt to extract one or more 
items having monetary value. The disclosed embodiments 
may also identify the group of purchasers responsible for 
paying the bill associated with the receipt and determine how 
the bill is to be distributed between the group of purchasers 
based on the extracted one or more items. The disclosed 
embodiments may also generate and provide a link to a pay 
ment web page to each of the purchasers for collecting the 
distributed portion of the bill. Accordingly, some embodi 
ments provide mechanisms that allow purchasers to easily 
distribute the payment of a bill associated with a receipt and 
enable each of the purchasers to pay the portion of the bill 
he/she is responsible for. 
0005 Consistent with some disclosed embodiments, tan 
gible computer-readable storage media may store program 
instructions that are executable by one or more processors to 
implement any of the processes disclosed herein. 
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0006. It is to be understood that both the foregoing general 
description and the following detailed description are exem 
plary and explanatory only, and are not restrictive of the 
disclosed embodiments. 

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

0007 FIG. 1A is diagram of an exemplary system that 
may be used to implement disclosed embodiments. 
0008 FIG. 1B is diagram of an exemplary client that may 
be used to implement disclosed embodiments. 
0009 FIG. 2 is an exemplary receipt splitting process flow 
consistent with the disclosed embodiments. 

0010 FIG. 3 is a screenshot of exemplary interface screen 
for parsing information in the receipt to extract items having 
monetary values consistent with the disclosed embodiments. 
0011 FIG. 4 is a screenshot of exemplary interface screen 
for obtaining the contact information of a group of purchasers 
consistent with the disclosed embodiments. 

0012 FIG. 5 is a screenshot of exemplary interface screen 
for confirming the purchasers consistent with the disclosed 
embodiments. 

0013 FIG. 6 is a screenshot of exemplary interface screen 
for sending a web page to a purchaser for collecting the 
payment for a bill consistent with the disclosed embodiments. 
0014 FIG. 7 is a screenshot of exemplary interface screen 
for a purchaser to make the payment for a bill consistent with 
the disclosed embodiments. 

DESCRIPTION OF THE EMBODIMENTS 

0015. It is to be understood that the following detailed 
description is exemplary and explanatory only and is not 
restrictive of disclosed embodiments. For example, steps or 
processes disclosed herein are not limited to being performed 
in the order described, but may be performed in any order, and 
that some steps may be omitted, consistent with the disclosed 
embodiments. 

0016 Reference will now be made in detail to exemplary 
embodiments, examples of which are illustrated in the 
accompanying drawings and disclosed herein. Wherever con 
Venient, the same reference numbers may be used in the 
drawings and the following description to refer to the same or 
similar parts. Also, similarly named elements may perform 
similar functions and may be similarly designed. Numerous 
details are set forth to provide an understanding of the 
embodiments described herein. In some cases, the embodi 
ments may be practiced without these details. In other 
instances, well-known techniques and/or components may 
not be described in detail to avoid obscuring described 
embodiments. While several exemplary embodiments and 
features are described herein, modifications, adaptations, and 
other implementations may be possible, without departing 
from the spirit and scope of the disclosure. Accordingly, the 
following detailed description does not limit the disclosure. 
Instead, the proper scope of the disclosure is defined by the 
appended claims. 
0017 FIG. 1A shows an exemplary system 100 configured 
to perform one or more processes consistent with the dis 
closed embodiments. In certain aspects, one or more compo 
nents of system 100 may be configured to execute one or more 
Software processes to provide one or more aspects of the 
disclosed embodiments. The components and arrangement 
shown in FIG. 1A are not intended to be limiting to the 
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disclosed embodiments as the components that may be used 
to implement certain disclosed processes and features may 
vary. 

0018. In accordance with disclosed embodiments, system 
100 may include financial service provider 110, receipt split 
ter 102, network 112, one or more clients 114. System 100 
may include other components to provide, collect, process, 
and transmit information consistent with the disclosed 
embodiments. 
0019 Receipt splitter 102 may be a computer-based sys 
tem including computer system components, such as one or 
more servers, desktop computers, workstations, memory 
devices, and/or internal network(s) connecting the compo 
nents. In some embodiments, receipt splitter 102 may be a 
server that includes one or more processor(s) 104, memory 
devices, such as memory 108, and interface components 106. 
Receipt splitter 102 may be a single server or may be config 
ured as a distributed computer system including multiple 
servers or computers that interoperate to perform one or more 
of the processes and functionalities associated with the dis 
closed embodiments. In certain embodiments, a receipt split 
ter server may be implemented as Software located on a single 
physical processing device, or may be multiple Software 
server programs stored on the same or multiple memory 
devices in a distributed manner. 

0020. In certain embodiments, receipt splitter 102 may be 
a server that is associated with financial service provider 110. 
Financial service provider 110 may represent, for example, a 
bank, a merchant, a credit card provider, or any other entity 
that provides financial services to customers. In some aspects, 
financial service provider 110 may be an institution or an 
individual that collects and processes the payment for a bill 
associated with a receipt, and transfers the payment to one or 
more intended payees. In other aspects, the functionalities 
performed by receipt splitter 102 as disclosed herein may be 
Software that is executed by one or more processors associ 
ated with financial service provider 110. That is, instead of 
being computer-based system with hardware and software, 
receipt splitter 102 may represent software instructions stored 
in a memory (without hardware components) that are 
executed by a processor associated with financial service 
provider 110. The disclosed embodiments are not limited to 
receipt splitter 102 being associated with a financial service 
provider 110. For example, receipt splitter 102 may be asso 
ciated with other types of entities, such as a merchant, retailer, 
or any other entity that may provide receipt splitting pro 
cesses consistent with the disclosed embodiments. 

0021 Processor(s) 104 may be one or more known pro 
cessing devices, such as a microprocessor from the Pen 
tiumTM family manufactured by IntelTM or the TurionTM fam 
ily manufactured by AMDTM. Processor(s) 104 may include a 
single core or multiple core processor system that provides 
the ability to perform parallel processes simultaneously. For 
example, processor(s) 104 may be a single core processor that 
is configured with virtual processing technologies known to 
those skilled in the art. In some embodiments, processor(s) 
104 may use logical processors to simultaneously execute and 
control multiple processes. Processor(s) 104 may implement 
virtual machine technologies, or other similar known tech 
nologies to provide the ability to execute, control, run, 
manipulate, store, etc. multiple software processes, applica 
tions, programs, etc. In other embodiments, processor(s) 104 
may include a multiple-core processor arrangement (e.g., 
dual or quad core) that is configured to provide parallel pro 
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cessing functionalities to allow receipt splitter 102 to execute 
multiple processes simultaneously. One of ordinary skill in 
the art would understand that other types of processor 
arrangements could be implemented that provide for the 
capabilities disclosed herein. 
0022 Receipt splitter 102 may also include one or more 
storage devices configured to store instructions used by pro 
cessor(s) 104 (or other components) to perform certain func 
tions related to the disclosed embodiments. In one example, 
receipt splitter 102 may include memory 108 that includes 
instructions to enable processor(s) 104 to execute one or more 
applications, such as server applications, network communi 
cation processes, or any other type of application or Software 
available on computer systems. Alternatively, the instruc 
tions, application programs. etc. may be stored in an external 
storage or available from a memory over a network. The one 
or more storage devices may be a volatile or non-volatile, 
magnetic, semiconductor, tape, optical, removable, non-re 
movable, or other type of storage device or tangible com 
puter-readable medium. 
0023 Methods, systems, and computer programs consis 
tent with the disclosed embodiments are not limited to sepa 
rate programs or computers configured to perform dedicated 
tasks. For example, receipt splitter 102 may include a 
memory that may include one or more programs to perform 
one or more functions for multiple user display control. 
Moreover, processor(s) 104 may execute one or more pro 
grams located remotely from system 100. For example, sys 
tem 100 may access one or more remote programs, that, when 
executed, perform functions related to disclosed embodi 
ments. Memory 108 may include one or more memory 
devices that store data and instructions used to perform one or 
more features of the disclosed embodiments. Memory 108 
may also include any combination of one or more databases 
controlled by memory controller devices (e.g., server(s), etc.) 
or software, such as document management systems, 
Microsoft SQL databases, SharePoint databases, OracleTM 
databases, SybaseTM databases, or other relational databases. 
0024. Receipt splitter 102 may also be communicatively 
connected to one or more memory devices (e.g., databases 
(not shown)) locally or through a network. The remote 
memory devices may be configured to store information and 
may be accessed and/or managed by receipt splitter 102. By 
way of example, the remote memory devices may be docu 
ment management systems, Microsoft SQL database, Share 
Point databases, OracleTM databases, SybaseTM databases, or 
other relational databases. Systems, processes, computer pro 
grams, and tangible computer-readable medium of disclosed 
embodiments, however, are not limited to separate databases 
or even to the use of a database. 

0025 Receipt splitter 102 may also include one or more 
I/O devices that may comprise one or more interfaces for 
receiving signals or input from input devices and providing 
signals or output to one or more output devices that allow data 
to be received and/or transmitted by receipt splitter 102. For 
example, receipt splitter 102 may include interface compo 
nents 106 that may provide interfaces to one or more input 
devices. Such as one or more keyboards, mouse devices, and 
the like, that enable receipt splitter 102 to receive data from 
one or more users such as client(s) 114. Furthermore, inter 
face components 106 may include components configured to 
send and receive information between components of receipt 
splitter 102 or external to receipt splitter 102, such as network 
112. 
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0026. Network 112 may be any type of network that pro 
vides communications, exchanges information, and/or facili 
tates the exchange of information between receipt splitter 102 
and client(s) 114. In one embodiment, network 112 may be 
the Internet, a Local Area Network, or other suitable connec 
tion(s) that enables system 100 to send and receive informa 
tion between the components of system 100. 
0027 Client(s) 114 may be one or more computer sys 
tems. For example, client(s) 114 may include a general pur 
pose or notebook computer, a mobile device with computing 
ability, a server, a desktop computer, tablet, or any combina 
tion of these computers and/or affiliated components. For 
example, client(s) 114 may be a Smartphone, which is con 
figured to perform one or more of the functions consistent 
with the disclosed embodiments. In some embodiments, each 
client may be a computer system or device that is operated by 
a user who is a customer or a potential customer of financial 
service provider 110. Client(s) 114 may be configured with 
storage that stores one or more operating systems that per 
form known operating system functions when executed by 
one or more processors. By way of example, the operating 
systems may include Microsoft WindowsTM, UnixTM, 
LinuxTM, AppleTM Computers type operating systems, Per 
Sonal Digital Assistant (PDA) type operating systems, such as 
Microsoft CETM, or other types of operating systems. Accord 
ingly, embodiments of the disclosed invention will operate 
and function with computer systems running any type of 
operating system. Client(s) 114 may also include communi 
cation software that, when executed by a processor, provides 
communications with network 112, such as Web browser 
software, tablet or smart hand held device networking soft 
Ware, etc. 
0028. In certain embodiments, receipt splitter 102 may 
execute software that provides a receipt splitter application to 
client 114 for providing receipt splitter processes consistent 
with the disclosed embodiments, FIG. 1B shows an exem 
plary client 114 including a processor(s) 204 and a memory 
208 including a receipt splitter application 202. In one aspect, 
receipt splitter 102 may send a receipt splitter mobile appli 
cation to client 114 (which may be a mobile device). Alter 
natively, client 114 may receive a receipt splitter application 
from another source. Such as a mobile application store via 
online application services. Client 114 may be configured to 
receive and store (e.g., in memory 208) the receipt splitter 
mobile application for execution to perform certain processes 
consistent with certain disclosed embodiments. Client 114 
may execute the receipt splitter application via, for example, 
processor 204, in response to a user input (e.g., selecting an 
icon representing the receipt splitter application on their 
mobile device). Other manners to initiate execution of the 
receipt splitter application may also be implemented depend 
ing on the type of device that the application software is 
running on. 
0029. Aspects of the disclosed embodiments are disclosed 
in an exemplary scenario involving a group of purchasers who 
received a receipt from a restaurant business. However, 
aspects of the disclosed embodiments may be implemented to 
perform purchase splitting processes consistent with that dis 
closed herein for other types of documents, such as invoices, 
electronic invoices, bills, etc., payment requests from other 
types of entities or organizations, businesses, individuals 
(e.g., personal payment transactions between individuals), 
contractors. Thus, a receipt is not limited to a receipt provided 
by a retailer, a merchant, or the like (e.g., a restaurant bill, 
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etc.), that provides items or services. A receipt may include 
other types of documents that may reflect a Summary of items 
or services that were or may be provided, such as a document 
reflecting down payment for one or more items or services, 
etc. 

0030 FIG. 2 illustrates an exemplary process flow for 
performing receipt splitting processes consistent with the 
disclosed embodiments, such as, for example, splitting a bill 
based on the information in a receipt and collecting the pay 
ments associated with the bill from a group of purchasers. 
One or more processes of FIG.2 may be performed by receipt 
splitter 102 or may be performed by receipt splitter applica 
tion 202 executing on a client 114, or a combination of both. 
0031 Certain disclosed embodiments may be configured 
to perform processes including receiving a receipt from a user 
(some aspects are discussed in greater detail at step 210), 
parsing the information in the receipt and extractitems having 
monetary value (some aspects are discussed in greater detail 
at Step 220), identifying a group of purchasers responsible for 
paying the bill associated with the receipt (some aspects are 
discussed in greater detail at step 230), splitting the bill 
among the group of purchasers (some aspects are discussed in 
greater detail at step 240), and collected the payment from 
each of the group of purchasers (some aspects are discussed in 
greater detail at step 250). 
0032. In one embodiment, client 114 may be configured to 
execute receipt splitter application 202 to allow a user, who 
may be one of the purchasers in a group of purchasers, to 
collect receipt information from a receipt whose underlying 
bill will be split among the group of purchasers (e.g., step 
210). Receipt splitter application 202 may receive the receipt 
or information relating to the receipt in different formats. For 
example, the user of client 114 may use image capture mecha 
nisms included on client 114 that enable the user to capture an 
image (e.g., a digital photograph) of the receipt. In embodi 
ments where receipt splitter 102 performs certain operations 
consistent with the disclosed embodiments, client 114 may 
send the captured image or receipt information to receipt 
splitter 102. For example, client 114 (e.g., a Smartphone or a 
tablet) may send an electronic copy of the captured image of 
the receipt to receipt splitter 102. 
0033. In other embodiments, receipt splitter application 
202 may receive information relating to the receipt in a bar 
code format. For example, the user of client 114 may use 
image capture mechanisms included on client 114 to capture 
barcode encoding information relating to a receipt, and send 
the captured barcode to receipt splitter 102. If the barcode is 
already stored on client 114, receipt splitter application 202 
may be configured to generate an interface that is displayed 
on client 114 of the user that allows the user to upload the 
electronic barcode and send it to receipt splitter 102. In other 
aspects, client 114 (e.g., a Smartphone or a tablet) may use 
mechanisms included on client 114 that enable the user to 
scan the barcode of the receipt and send it to receipt splitter 
102. In certain embodiments, receipt splitter application 202 
may execute software that causes client 114 to store the 
receipt image (or receipt information) in a memory on client 
114. Receipt splitter application 202 may also execute soft 
ware processes that cause client 114 to perform image pro 
cesses on the image, such as OCR processes, to produce 
receipt information usable by receipt splitter application 202 
(or receipt splitter 102). In some embodiments, receipt split 
ter application 202 may execute Software processes (e.g., 
OR-Code Readers) that cause client 114 to perform barcode 
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reading processes on the barcode provided by the user of 
client 114, to produce receipt information encoded in the 
barcode usable by receipt splitter application 202 (or receipt 
splitter 102). 
0034. In one aspect, receipt splitter application 202 may 
use the receipt information produced by the image process 
(es) (e.g., OCR process) to parse and extract certain informa 
tion from the receipt (e.g., step 220). In some aspects, receipt 
splitter application 202 may parse the information in the 
receipt to extract the line items and their corresponding mon 
etary values. For example, receipt splitter application 202 
may be configured to extract the purchased items, together 
with taxes and service charges (e.g., tips), and the total value 
on the receipt. In other aspects, receipt splitter application 
202 may parse the information in the receipt to extract infor 
mation relating to any Survey that may be conducted. For 
example, if the receipt includes a website address on the 
receipt soliciting a user to participate in a Survey, receipt 
splitter application 202 may be configured to retrieve this 
information, and generate an active link to the website that 
when selected directs the user to the website to participate in 
the Survey. In other aspects, receipt splitter application 202 
may be configured to parse the information in the receipt to 
extract information relating to any reward or loyalty program 
(e.g., coupon, discount, reward points, or the like). FIG. 3 
shows a process flow of an exemplary receipt collection pro 
cess consistent with disclosed embodiments. 
0035. In certain embodiments, receipt splitter application 
202 may be configured to perform process(es) that identifies 
the purchases included in the group of purchasers who may be 
responsible for, or involved with, paying the bill associated 
with the receipt (e.g., step 230). In one aspect, receipt splitter 
application 202 may be configured to generate an interface 
that is displayed on client 114 of the user that allows the user 
to input identification information for one or more other pur 
chasers who will split the receipt with the user. The interface 
may include input mechanisms that allow the user to input the 
name and/or contact information (e.g., email, phone number, 
social network handle(s), etc.) of each purchaser. FIG. 4 
shows a diagram of an exemplary interface that may be pro 
vided by receipt splitter application 202 that includes the 
name and phone number (e.g., mobile phone number) of the 
other purchasers. 
0036. In other embodiments, to minimize the user's efforts 
of providing purchaser identification information, receipt 
splitter application 202 may be configured to determine Sug 
gested one or more candidates that may participate in paying 
the bill associated with the receipt. For example, receipt split 
ter application 202 may perform Software processes that inte 
grate with one or more social networking sites (e.g., Twitter, 
Facebook, LinkedIn, or the like) to obtain information regard 
ing who might present at the location of client 114 associated 
with the user at the time when the user initiates or uses the 
receipt splitting processes of receipt splitter application 202. 
Thus, receipt splitter application 202 may be configured to 
identify one or more candidates based on the users (or client 
114s) location. For example, when the user initiates the 
execution of receipt splitter application202 installed on client 
114, receipt splitter application 202 may be configured to 
detect the user's location. 
0037. In one aspect, receipt splitter application 202 may 
request and receive GPS location information from a GPS 
process installed and executing on client 114 to determine the 
location of the user (or client 114). For example, client 114 
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may include and execute location processes Such as four 
square, Google Latitude, and the like. Based on the detected 
location, receipt splitter application 202 may provide the 
users (or client 114s) location to receipt splitter 102. In 
certain embodiments, one or more other purchasers with the 
user at the purchasing event associated with the receipt (e.g., 
who are with the user and will split the bill with the user) may 
also use a respective client device (e.g., client 114) having a 
corresponding receipt splitter application 202 installed. The 
receipt splitter application 202 executing on the client 114 
associated with the one or more purchasers may also send to 
receipt splitter 102 GPS location information identifying the 
location of the respective purchaser(s). Receipt splitter 202 
may receive the location information for the user and the one 
or more purchasers and determine whether the one or more 
purchasers are within a certain distance of the user (e.g., 
within a few feet, at the same address, etc.). Receipt splitter 
102 may then determine and collect identification informa 
tion for those purchaser(s) and send them to the receipt split 
ter application 202 on client 114 of the user. Receipt splitter 
application 202 executing on the user's client 114 may 
receive the purchaser identification information and integrate 
that information into a list of candidates for the user to view 
on a display, such as that shown in FIG. 4. 
0038. In some embodiments, to ensure the accuracy of the 
Suggested candidate(s), receipt splitter application 202 may 
be configured to perform process(es) that allows the user to 
confirm whether a candidate purchaser is to participate in the 
receipt splitting process. For example, receipt splitter appli 
cation 202 may be configured to perform process(es) that 
enables the user to add and/or delete one or more Suggested 
candidates. FIG. 5 shows an exemplary interface including a 
user's confirmation of a candidate purchaser (e.g., checkbox 
for “Bryan'). Other mechanisms for confirming the one or 
more participating purchasers may be implemented, and the 
disclosed embodiments are not limited to the features exem 
plified in FIGS. 4 and 5, or any other interfaces described 
herein. In one aspect, receipt splitter application 202 may 
include in the list of candidates the user associated with client 
114 so that the user can select himself or herself as a partici 
pating purchaser. In other aspects, receipt splitter application 
202 may automatically identify the user and include the user 
in the list participating purchasers. For instance, in one 
aspect, receipt splitter application 202 may include in the 
interface the name and contact information for the user along 
with the other candidate purchasers, with the user's checkbox 
automatically selected by receipt splitter application 202. 
0039. Aspects of the disclosed embodiments enable a user 
(or the group of purchasers) to select how the receipt is to be 
distributed. In one aspect, receipt splitter application 202 may 
present an option in an interface displayed on the user's client 
114 that requests that the user confirm that the bill for the 
receipt will be split evenly. FIG. 5 shows an exemplary “Split 
Evenly’ option that the user may select. Other options may be 
offered by the disclosed embodiments. For example, receipt 
splitter application 202 may provide an option for the user to 
select a percentage for each participating purchaser will con 
tribute. Thus, the disclosed embodiments allow the bill to be 
split in one or more ways including, for example, splitting 
evenly or by percentage, assigning one or more purchased 
items and related charges to one or more purchasers in the 
group, or the like. 
0040. In certain aspects, the disclosed embodiments may 
be configured to provide a mechanism that allows the user and 
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the group of purchasers to be involved in how to split the bill 
associated with the receipt. For example, receipt splitter 
application 102 may be configured to send to each client 114 
having a receipt splitter application 202 associated with the 
purchasers (including the user), the itemized list of items 
generated from the receipt capture processes disclosed above. 
In Such aspects, the receipt splitter application 202 on the 
client 114 for the user may have sent a copy of the itemized 
list to receipt splitter 102, or receipt splitter 102 may have 
generated the itemized list based on an image of the receipt 
provided by the client 114. The receipt splitter application 
202 on each client 114 for the purchaser(s) may display, on an 
interface, the purchased items and any related charges (e.g., 
taxes, service charges) associated with the receipt. The 
receipt splitter application 202 on each client 114 may enable 
each purchaser to choose one or more items that he/she will be 
responsible for paying. Additionally or alternatively, the 
receipt splitter application 202 for each purchaser may be 
configured to allow the purchaser to enter the amount of 
money he/she should be responsible for. Each receipt splitter 
application 202 may send the selections from the purchasers 
to receipt splitter 102, which processes the information to 
generate a final receipt splitter list for the receipt that indicates 
the amount owed by each purchaser. 
0041. In other embodiments, receipt splitter 102 may be 
configured to perform the processes described above. For 
example, receipt splitter application 202 may generate and 
provide a link to a website or other location associated with 
receipt splitter 102 that the purchaser, via a client 114, will be 
directed to when selected. Receipt splitter 102 may generate 
an interface that is displayed on each purchaser's client 114 
that includes the itemized list of items and allows each pur 
chaser to select the items that they will pay, or to enter in the 
amount of money the purchaser may contribute to the cost of 
the bill for the receipt. 
0042 Based on the selection of how the bill will be split, 
receipt splitter application 202 (or receipt splitter 102) may 
perform processes to split the bill associated with the receipt 
(e.g., Step 240). In one aspect, the disclosed embodiments 
may use contact information for each purchaser to facilitate 
payment for the bill (e.g., step 250). 
0043. In one aspect, receipt splitter application202 may be 
configured to obtain the contact information for each of the 
selected one or more purchasers who may participate in the 
receipt splitting process. In one aspect, receipt splitter appli 
cation 202 may use the contact information provided in the 
list of purchasers (e.g., FIG. 5). In other embodiments, receipt 
splitter application 202 may execute that obtains purchaser 
contact information via other sources. Such as Social network 
ing sites, the user's contact list stored on client 114, etc. 
0044 Based on the determined way of splitting the bill 
associated with the receipt, receipt splitter application 202 
may be configured to collect payment from the purchasers 
(including the user) (e.g., step 250). In some embodiments, 
receipt splitter application 202 may be configured to generate 
an interface that is displayed on the users (or purchaser’s) 
client 114 including information reflecting the amount owed 
by the user or purchaser. For example, the interface may 
include information reflecting the purchased items, the total 
value on the receipt, and/or the total amount the particular 
user/purchaser should be responsible for. FIG. 6 shows an 
exemplary receipt splitting interface may be provided to a 
user indicating the amount owed by the user. Other types of 
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interfaces and information provided in the interfaces may be 
implemented and provided by the disclosed embodiments. 
0045 Certain disclosed embodiments provide mecha 
nisms that enable the user/purchaser to make the payment for 
the distributed bill. In certain aspects, each client 114 includ 
ing a receipt splitter application 202 may execute processes 
that receive the distribution amount to apply to the respective 
purchaser, and generate an interface that enables the user to 
provide electronic payment for the distributed amount 
assigned to that purchaser. In other aspects, receipt splitter 
102 may provide similar functionalities by providing a web 
site or other medium that the purchaser(s) can access and use 
to facilitate payment. 
0046 For example, receipt splitter application 202 may 
generate interfaces that allow the user/purchaser to select the 
type of electronic payment method to use to pay the bill. FIG. 
6 shows in the exemplary interface an option for the user to 
select that will initiate electronic payment (e.g., “Pay Now”). 
Upon selection, receipt splitter application 202 may provide 
an interface that allows the user to select the type of electronic 
payment service or financial service product to use to pay the 
distributed amount of the bill for the user/purchaser. FIG. 7 
shows an exemplary interface that may be provided and dis 
played via client 114 to allow a user/purchaser to make pay 
ment for their distributed amount for the bill associated with 
the receipt. 
0047 Thus, for example, receipt splitter application 202 
may be configured to provide options for the user to provide 
payment via one or more Ways such as, for example, credit 
card or debit card (which may be associated with financial 
service provider 110), PayPalTM, reward points, or any other 
known method of electronic payment. In such embodiments, 
receipt splitter application 202 may generate an interface to 
collect payment information from the purchaser. The dis 
closed embodiments may use known electronic payment pro 
cesses to collect payment from the purchaser. 
0048. In certain embodiments, receipt splitter 102 may be 
configured to perform Software processes consistent with the 
functionalities disclosed above. 
0049. In certain aspects, receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt 
splitter application 202 may be configured to perform other 
functions consistent with the disclosed embodiments. For 
example, the user of client 114 may make a payment request 
on client 114 without providing a receipt consistent with the 
disclosed embodiments. For example, receipt splitter appli 
cation 202 may be configured to generate an interface that is 
displayed on client 114 of the user that allows the user to 
provide information relating to the bill to be split (e.g., the 
event triggering the bill, the monetary value to be split). In 
Some aspects, receipt splitter application 202 may execute 
software that allows the user of client 114 to send information 
relating to the event triggering the bill when making the 
payment request. For example, the user of client 114 may 
upload a ticket for a special event that triggers the bill (e.g., 
sports, concerts, theater). 
0050. As another example, if a receipt that was provided 
by the user to client 114 included information reflecting a 
website address, such as an address for the user to conduct a 
survey, receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter application 
202 may be configured to extract the website address infor 
mation from the receipt when processing the receipt informa 
tion (e.g., after OCR processes completed, after QR-Code 
reading processes completed). The Survey may be provided in 
the form of a barcode or text reflecting the website address. 
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Receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter application 202 
may perform processes that recognizes the address informa 
tion and generates a link to the address that may be included 
in an interface displayed by client 114. In other embodiments, 
receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter application 202 may 
be configured to generate and send a notification to the user 
using other mediums, such as an email, SMS messaging, etc. 
In other embodiments, receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt 
splitter application 202 may be configured to receive and 
store the results of any Survey that the user may have per 
formed based on the provided website address. For example, 
if conducting the Survey entitles the user to some rewards 
(e.g., discount, gift card, loyalty points, etc.), receipt splitter 
102 and/or receipt splitter application 202 may be configured 
to store reward information that may be used by receipt split 
ter 102 and/or receipt splitter application 202 at another time 
the user performs receipt splitting processes consistent with 
the disclosed embodiments. 

0051. As another example, if the receipt contains informa 
tion relating to a reward program for future purchases (e.g., 
discount, coupon), receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter 
application 202 may be configured to identify and extract the 
information relating to the reward program. Based on this 
information, receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter appli 
cation 202 may be configured to generate an interface for 
display on client 114 to distribute the reward to the purchasers 
participating in the receipt splitting process for paying the bill 
associated with the receipt. The client 114 associated with 
each purchaser may receive a notification that the user has 
distributed the reward to the purchaser via receipt splitter 102 
and/or receipt splitter application 202. In certain aspects, 
receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter application 202 may 
be configured to store the reward information in a memory for 
use by one or more accounts associated with the participating 
purchasers for possible application to future purchase(s). 
0052. As another example, receipt splitter 102 and/or 
receipt splitter application 202 may be configured to generate 
and provide for display on client 114 one or more commercial 
messages. For example, before or during a receipt splitting 
event associated with a bill to be split, receipt splitter 102 
and/or receipt splitter application 202 may be configured to 
generate and provide a message that includes information 
relating to one or more promotional offer (e.g., discount) if 
the user spends a certain amount of money, purchases a cer 
tain item or service, etc. 
0053. In another embodiment, receipt splitter 102 and/or 
receipt splitter application 202 may be configured to perform 
processes that integrate with Social networking sites (e.g., 
Twitter, Facebook, LinkedIn) to perform functions that allow 
the user to communicate via these social networking sites. For 
example, receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter applica 
tion 202 may perform processes that enable the user to pro 
vide comments regarding whether the user likes or dislikes 
the business associated with the receipt, and/or to check 
whether there are some special deals provided by the busi 
ness. Receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter application 
202 may provide the comments to the Social networking site 
of the user's choice, or provide a link directly to the social 
networking site that the user may use to access and use that 
site. 

0054. In other embodiments, receipt splitter 102 may be 
configured to provide processes that allow the user to rate 
his/her experience relating to receipt splitting processes con 
sistent with the disclosed embodiments. In some embodi 
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ments, receipt splitter 102 and/or receipt splitter application 
202 may be configured to perform processes that allow the 
user to share his/her experiences using Social networking sites 
or other broadcast mediums. 
0055. In one embodiment, receipt splitter 102 and/or 
receipt splitter application 202 may be configured to perform 
gamification functions. For example, receipt splitter 102 and/ 
or receipt splitter application 202 may perform process(es) 
that determines and generates one or more incentives (both 
virtual and/or real) for rewarding the user for using the receipt 
splitting application software on client 114. Virtual rewards 
may include earning status Such as, for example, a gold/silver/ 
bronze or SuperStar/starlet/standing ratings associated with 
the user and/or the user's financial service account used to pay 
for the portion of the bill using the receipt splitting processes. 
Real and virtual rewards may also be given for sharing the bill 
splitting experience via Social networking sites and recom 
mending it to other entities or users (e.g., friends, business 
partners, etc.). The disclosed embodiments may execute soft 
ware that may convert virtual rewards to real awards based on 
the rating level. For example, when receipt splitter 102 or 
receipt splitter application 202 determines that the user has 
used the receipt splitter application 202 a certain number of 
times, and thus has reached a certain virtual reward level, the 
application may provide or notify client 114 of real reward 
offers (or inform receipt splitter 102 to initiate or provide a 
real reward offer). Such as discounts, monetary transfers, 
coupons, etc. 
0056. The disclosed embodiments may be associated to 
different types of financial services. Any financial institution 
that provides financial service accounts to customers may 
employ systems, methods, and articles of manufacture con 
sistent with certain principles related to the disclosed embodi 
ments. In addition, other types of entities, such as a merchant, 
retailer, or other type corporate entity that may also employ 
systems, methods, and articles of manufacture consistent 
with certain disclosed embodiments. 
0057. Furthermore, although aspects of the disclosed 
embodiments are described as being associated with data 
stored in memory and other tangible computer-readable stor 
age mediums, one skilled in the art will appreciate that these 
aspects can also be stored on and executed from many types of 
tangible computer-readable media, Such as secondary storage 
devices, like hard disks, floppy disks, or CD-ROM, or other 
forms of RAM or ROM. Accordingly, the disclosed embodi 
ments are not limited to the above described examples, but 
instead is defined by the appended claims in light of their full 
Scope of equivalents. 
What is claimed is: 
1. A system for providing receipt splitting processes, com 

prising: 
a processor; and 
a storage device storing instructions that, when executed by 

the processor, cause the system to perform operations 
comprising: 
receiving receipt information reflecting a bill for one or 
more purchased items or services, the bill including a 
total monetary amount, 

generating an itemized list of the one or more purchased 
items or services based on the receipt information, 

identifying a set of purchasers for paying the bill asso 
ciated with the receipt, 

determining a payment amount for each identified pur 
chaser based on the itemized list of the one or more 
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purchased items or services, wherein the payment 
amount for each identified purchaser is a proportion 
of the total monetary amount of the bill, and 

providing an interface that allows at least one purchaser 
to make an electronic payment for the at least one 
purchaser's proportional payment amount. 

2. The system of claim 1, wherein the operations include 
parsing the receipt information to extract website address 
information relating to a Survey from the receipt information. 

3. The system of claim 2, wherein the operations include 
providing a website link to a website associated with the 
survey based on the extracted website address information. 

4. The system of claim 1, wherein the operations further 
include receiving a selection from a user that identifies the set 
of purchasers for paying the bill associated with the receipt. 

5. The system of claim 4, wherein the operations further 
include receiving a selection from a user that identifies how 
the bill is to be split among the identified set of purchasers. 

6. The system of claim 1, wherein the operations further 
include receiving the receipt information in at least one of a 
plurality of formats, the plurality of formats comprising bar 
code and image formats. 

7. The system of claim 1, wherein the operations further 
include providing integrations with at least one Social net 
working site. 

8. A method for performing receipt splitting, comprising: 
receiving, by one or more processors, receipt information 

reflecting a bill for one or more purchased items or 
services, the bill including a total monetary amount; 

generating, by the one or more processors, an itemized list 
of the one or more purchased items or services based on 
the receipt information; 

identifying, by the one or more processors, a set of pur 
chasers for paying the bill associated with the receipt; 

determining, by the one or more processors, a payment 
amount for each identified purchaser based on the item 
ized list of the one or more purchased items or services, 
wherein the payment amount for each identified pur 
chaser is a proportion of the total monetary amount of 
the bill; and 

providing, by the one or more processors, an interface that 
allows at least one purchaser to make an electronic pay 
ment for the at least one purchaser's proportional pay 
ment amount. 

9. The method of claim 8, further comprising parsing the 
receipt information to extract website address information 
relating to a Survey from the receipt information. 

10. The method of claim 9, further comprising providing a 
website link to a website associated with the survey based on 
the extracted website address information. 
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11. The method of claim 8, further comprising receiving a 
selection from a user that identifies the set of purchasers for 
paying the bill associated with the receipt. 

12. The method of claim 11, further comprising receiving 
a selection from a user that identifies how the bill is to be split 
among the identified set of purchasers. 

13. The method of claim 8, further comprising receiving 
the receipt information in at least one of a plurality of formats, 
the plurality of formats comprising barcode and image for 
matS. 

14. The method of claim 8, further comprising providing 
integrations with at least one social networking site. 

15. A non-transitory computer readable medium storing 
instructions that, when executed by a processor, cause the 
processor to: 

receive receipt information reflecting a bill for one or more 
purchased items or services, the bill including a total 
monetary amount; 

generate an itemized list of the one or more purchased 
items or services based on the receipt information; 

identify a set of purchasers for paying the bill associated 
with the receipt: 

determine a payment amount for each identified purchaser 
based on the itemized list of the one or more purchased 
items or services, wherein the payment amount for each 
identified purchaser is a proportion of the total monetary 
amount of the bill; and 

provide an interface that allows at least one purchaser to 
make an electronic payment for the at least one purchas 
er's proportional payment amount. 

16. The medium of claim 15, wherein the instructions 
further cause the processor to parse the receipt information to 
extract website address information relating to a Survey from 
the receipt information. 

17. The medium of claim 16, wherein the instructions 
further cause the processor to provide a website link to a 
website associated with the survey based on the extracted 
website address information. 

18. The medium of claim 15, wherein the instructions 
further cause the processor to receive a selection from a user 
that identifies the set of purchasers for paying the bill associ 
ated with the receipt. 

19. The medium of claim 18, wherein the instructions 
further cause the processor to receive a selection from a user 
that identifies how the bill is to be split among the identified 
set of purchasers. 

20. The medium of claim 15, wherein the instructions 
further cause the processor to receive the receipt information 
in at least one of a plurality of formats, the plurality of formats 
comprising barcode and image formats. 

k k k k k 


