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UNITED STATES 

2003,746 

PATENT OFFICE 
2,003,746 

Book, CHART, AND REFERENCE HOLDER 
Florence E. Headington, Iowa City, Iowa 

Application June 1, 1934, Serial No. 728,604 
1. Claim. (CI. 45-80) 

The present invention relates to new and use 
ful improvements in holders for books, charts, 
and references, and has for its primary object to 
render easier and more pleasant, and thereby en 
courage the reading and studying of books, 
charts, references, etc. 
Another important object of the invention is 

to provide a holder of the aforementioned char 
acter which may be expeditiously adjusted to the 
desired position for the individual user, thus 
greatly eliminating eye strain and shoulder 
stOOping. 

Still another important object of the invention. 
is to provide, in a manner aS hereinafter set 
forth, a book, chart and reference holder of the 
character described which is adapted to be 
mounted for use on various Supports, Such as 
tables, stands or across the arms of a chair. 
Other objects of the invention are to provide 

a holder of the character set forth Which Will be 
comparatively simple in construction, Strong, 
durable, efficient and reliable in use, compact, 
light in weight, attractive in appearance and 
which may be manufactured at low cost. 

All of the foregoing and still further objects 
and advantages of the invention Will become ap 
parent from a study of the following Specifica 
tion, taken in connection. With the accompany 
ing drawings wherein like characters of refer 
ence designate corresponding parts throughout 
the several views, and wherein:- 

Figure is a front perspective view of a holder 
constructed in accordance with the present in 
vention, showing reading and reference books 
mounted thereon. 

Figure 2 is a rear perSpective view, showing the 
holder in open or Operative position. 

Figure 3 is a bottom plan View, ShOWing One 
of the slidable Supports in extended position. 

Figure 4 is a fragmentary view in vertical Sec 
tion, taken Substantially on the line 4-4 of Fig 
lure 2. 

Referring now to the drawings in detail, it 
will be seen that the embodiment Of the inven 
tion which has been illustrated comprises what 
Will be hereinafter referred to as a container 
which is designated generally by the reference 
numeral , said container being of any Suitable 
material and dimensions and including a, bottom 
2, a rear Wall 3 and Side Walls 4 the upper edges 
of which, it Will be noted, are inclined. 
Mounted for SWinging movement in a vertical 

plane on the forward portion of the bottom 2, 
as by hinges 5, is a platform 6 having mounted 
On its hinged edge a book Supporting ledge l'. 

When in closed position the platform 6 rests on 
the upper edges of the rear wall 3 and the side 
walls 4 of the container . The platform 6 is 
Supported in adjusted position through the me 
dium of a brace 7 which is hingedly mounted, 
as at 8, on the bottom 2 of the container , said 
brace being operatively engageable with a ratchet 
bar 9 which is mounted on the lower side of the 
platform 6. The brace T has formed therein a 
longitudinal slot 0 which slidably receives a 
guide if on the ratchet bar 9. 

Slidably and rotatably mounted in guides 2 on 
the lower side of the platform 6 are angular, 
resilient clamps i3 which, as illustrated to ad 
vantage in Figure 1 of the drawings, are adapted 
to secure a book 4 in open position on said plat 
form 6. It will be noted that certain of the 
clamps 3 are engageable With the upper por 
tion of the book 4 and that the remaining clamps 
3 are adapted to engage the side portions of Said 
book. As best seen in Figure 2 of the drawings, 
headed pins 5 are provided on the lower side of 
the platform 6 for retaining certain of the clamps 
3 in retracted or inoperative position in a man 
ner to prevent rattling thereof. The clamps 3 
are adapted to be flexed and engaged behind the 
headed pins 5, thus putting said clamps under 
tension and frictionally securing the same in in 
operative position. If desired or necessary, the 
elements 5 may be provided for all of the clamps. 
Suitable stops 6 may also be provided on the 
inner ends of the clamps 3 for preventing com 
plete withdrawal of said clamps from their 
guides 2. 
The reference numeral T designates a reference 

book holder which is also slidably mounted on the 
lower side of the platform 6, said reference book 
holder being adapted to project beyond the free 
end of said platform in the manner shown to ad 
Wantage in Figure of the drawings. The 
numeral f designates a reference book mounted 
in the holder . The reference book holder 

is preferably formed from a single length of 
Suitable resilient Wire formed to provide a Sub 
stantially U-shaped support 9 the legs of which 
are reversed or bent upon themselves in a man 
ner to provide resilient fingers 20 which are slid 
able in guides 2 provided therefor on the lower 
side of the platform 6 and Which are engageable 
With the reference book for holding said refer 
ence book in open position on the Support 9. In 
other words, the reference book is clamped be 
tween the portions 9 and 20 of the holder f7. 
Mounted for transverse sliding movement in 

guides 22 beneath the bottom 2 of the container 
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are wings 23 which are adapted to Support the de 
vice over and between the arms of a chair. The 
lower faces of the supporting Wings 23 have 
mounted thereon sheets 24 of felt or other suit 
able material to prevent damage to the chair arms. 
Projecting laterally from the inner end portions 
of the supporting Wings 23 are stops 25 which are 
engageable with the guides 22 for preventing de 
tachment of Said supporting Wings. The inner 
ends of the Supporting Wings 23 are engageable 
with a centrally located stop 26. In their outer 
portions, the Supporting Wings 23 are provided 
with finger receiving recesses 27 which facilitate 
sliding Said Supporting Wings to extended or 
operative position. Also mounted beneath the 
bottom 2 of the container are pads 28 which 
prevent damage to a table, stand or the like when 
the device is mounted thereon. The reference 
numeral 29 designates a trough in the container - 
for the reception of pencils, pens and other 
articles. 

It is believed that the manner of using the 
holder Will be readily apparent from a considera 
tion of the foregoing. The book being read or 
Studied is placed in open position on the plat 
form 6 and the said platform is, of course, ad 
justed to the desired position where it is Sup 
ported by the brace . The clamps 3 are then 
withdrawn from beneath the platform 6 and 
engaged with the book in the manner shown in 
Figure 1 of the drawings for Securing said book 
in open position, as hereinbefore explained. 
When a reference book is to be used the holder 
is slid to operative position from beneath the 
platform 6 for receiving said reference book. 
When it is desired to swing the platform 6 to 

2,003,746 
closed position on the container f it is only neces 
sary to disengage the brace T from the ratchet 
bar 9, as will be obvious. As will also be readily 
apparent, the platform 6 constitutes a closure 
for the container When said platform is in 
lowered position. The container may be utilized 
for the reception of various articles if desired. 

It is believed that the many advantages of a 
book, chart and reference holder constructed in 
accordance with the present invention will be 
readily understood, and although a preferred em 
bodiment of the invention is as illustrated and 
described, it is to be understood that changes in 
the details of construction and in the combina 
tion and arrangement of parts may be resorted to 
which will fall within the Scope of the invention 
as claimed. 
What is claimed is:- 
A holder of the class described comprising a 

Supporting structure, a platform hingedly 
mounted for Swinging adjustment on the Sup 
porting structure, means for Supporting the plat 
form in adjusted position, and means for Sup 
porting a reference book in open position on the 
free end of the platform, the last-named means 
including guides mounted beneath the platform, 
and a holder mounted in the guides, said holder 
being formed from a single piece of resilient 
material including a substantially U-shaped sup 
porting portion, the legs of Said Supporting por 
tion being bent upon themselves in a manner to 
provide resilient retaining fingers, said fingers 
substantially paralleling the legs of said support 
ing portion and being slidably engaged in the 
guides. 

FLORENCE E. HEADINGTON. 
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